
Shower Door Options
AG 1 AG 2 AG 3

GOOD BETTER BEST
Smart Choice for the 
Budget-Minded. This is our 
value option. We match a 
prefabricated door that fits 
your space best (may see 
small gaps). Still templated 
with laser accuracy, still 
installed with care, and still 
a clean, sharp look.

• NO TOWEL BARS
• Height: 72" to 80” (Custom 

height unavailable)
• Link to Prefabricated 

Doors
• Glass: Standard 3/8"
• Gap Between Door and 

Panel: ± 1/4''
• Hardware Color Options: 

Oil Rubbed Bronze, Matte 
Black, Polished Chrome, 
Gold, Polish Brass, Brushed 
Bronze or Satin Brass and 
Brushed Nickel

• Includes a 3-year 
warranty.

Clean, Custom, and Built to 
Last. You still get a 
custom-cut door based on 
our laser 
template—accurate to the 
1/16”. We use reliable glass 
and hardware that match 
your needs and still deliver 
a sharp, professional finish.

• Height: An increment 
from 70" to 84"

• Glass: Standard 3/8"
• Gap Between Door and 

Panel: ± 1/8''
• Hardware Color 

Options: All available 
offerings

• Includes a 3-year 
warranty.

For Clients Who Want the 
Absolute Best. Full custom 
glass, cut to fit your exact 
space with laser precision. 
Built with premium 
materials, coated to fight 
hard water, and hardware 
strong enough to outlast 
anything we throw at it. 
Installed by our best 
craftsman.

• Height: Any increment 
from 70" to 84"

• Glass: ShowerGuard or 
Hydro Clear with 
baked-in coating

• Gap Between Door and 
Panel: ± 1/8''

• Hardware Color 
Options: All available 
offerings

• Includes a lifetime 
warranty.

Add-Ons (For AG 1 and AG 2)
• ShowerGuard or Hydro Clear Glass: Lifetime warranty; $225 per panel


